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SUMMARY OF THE EVALUATED BID FOR SUPPLY OF CLEAN PETROLEUM PRODUCTS IN THE MONTH OF MARCH 

2020 

Discharge point C1 

SPM 

C2 

SPM 

C1 

KOJ1 

C2 

KOJ1 

C3 

KOJ1 

C4 

KOJ1 

C 

KOJ1 

COMBI CARGO, TANGA & MTWARA 

Product Gasoil Gasoil Mogas Mogas Mogas Mogas Jet A-1&IK  Gasoil Mogas IK 

Quantity in MT 96,687 94,687 31,246 31,746 31,084 30,909 30,237  8,300 12,950 2,000 

Price basis Average European Marketscan Platt’s Quotation for the month of February, 2020 (01st February, 2020 to 29th February, 2020); under the 

quote ‘Mean Fob Arab Gulf Gasoil 0.005% S’ 

Bidders DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

Weighted 

Average 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

ADDAX 

ENERGY SA 

34.500 32.700 30.300 34.200 37.130 37.130 59.000 56.000 56.000 56.000 56.000 

SAHARA 

ENERGY 

RESOURCES 

LIMITED 

35.750 30.880 34.270 35.940 33.360 32.360 NO BID 78.734 67.810 86.370 74.620 

TRAFIGURA 

PTE LIMITED 

39.750 39.300 42.410 48.390 48.390 48.390 68.660 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

TOTSA TOTAL 

OIL TRADING 

SA 

NO BID 38.300 47.320 40.830 40.980 42.380 53.850 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

GALANA 

PETROLEUM 

LTD 

NO BID 32.885   46.795 47.865      

VITOL 

BAHRAIN EC 

36.810 35.680 NO BID NO BID 46.330 42.330 56.730 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

AUGUSTA 

ENERGY DMCC 

  36.500 38.490 41.390 43.450      

GULF 

PETROCHEM 

FZC 

  56.840 57.640        

 

 Key Note:                   Lowest Premium 
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SUMMARY OF THE WINNERS FOR SUPPLY OF CLEAN PETROLEUM PRODUCTS IN THE MONTH 

OF MARCH 2020 

 

Tender Number Winner Delivery date range 

PBPA/CPP/AGO/C1-SPM/03/2020 ADDAX ENERGY SA 03-05 March 2020 

PBPA/CPP/AGO/C2-SPM/03/2020 SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED 16-18 March 2020 

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C1-KOJ1/03/2020   ADDAX ENERGY SA 04-06 March 2020 

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C2-KOJ1/03/2020 ADDAX ENERGY SA 10-12 March 2020 

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C3-KOJ1/03/2020 SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED 20-22 March 2020 

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C4-KOJ1/03/2020 SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED 26-28 March 2020 

PBPA/CPP/JETA-1&IK/C-KOJ1/03/2020 TOTSA TOTAL OIL TRADING SA 14-16 March 2020 

PBPA/CPP/COMBI/TANGA&MTWARA/03/2020 ADDAX ENERGY SA 20-22 March 2020 

 

 


